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Message from the Chair 
Galen Rathbun 
Chair, IUCN/SSC Afrotheria Specialist Group 
 
Newsworthy occurrences involving the smaller afrotheres 
are often few, at least compared with the charismatic 
elephants and sea cows, but since our last newsletter a 
couple of important events have occurred.  First, the 
number of species of Afrotheria increased when Steve 
Goodman and his colleagues described a new shrew 
tenrec (Microgale jobihely) from Madagascar (see abstracts 
on page 9).  Similarly, it appears that a new form of giant 
sengi (Rhynchocyon) from a remote and pristine forest in 
the Eastern Arc Mountains of Tanzania may have been 
found (Rovero and Rathbun 2006, see bibliography).  
Word on the grapevine says that we may also expect 
additional new species of sengis to be described in the 
near future…..stay tuned. Given that there are relatively 
few extant afrotheres, these discoveries result in a 
significant increase in the diversity of this radiation. 

The second noteworthy event is the increased 
interest in two afrotheres, which has resulted from some 
recent high profile publicity. A popular article on the 

tenrecs of Madagascar was written by our Tenrec Section 
Co-ordinator PJ Stephenson (2007), which has resulted in 
the BBC in the UK becoming interested in featuring 
streaked tenrecs (Hemicentetes) in their upcoming 
television series “LIFE”. Similarly, the golden-rumped 
sengi (R. chrysopygus) was singled out for special attention 
by the Zoological Society of London’s EDGE 
programme- http://www.edgeofexistence.org/home.asp. 
This publicity has resulted in several film producers 
focusing on this species, including the BBC. More 
importantly, the attention has resulted in potential 
support for a badly needed status and conservation 
survey for R. chrysopygus in coastal forests in northern 
Kenya (see news item on page 8). Both the tenrec and 
sengi efforts are good examples of the positive results 
that publicity can achieve. 

Andrew Taylor, who has served so ably as the 
Aardvark Section Co-ordinator since we formed our 
group, now has a postdoctoral position in Wyoming, 
USA.  Because of his new position, Andrew has switched 
rolls with Tom Lehmann, who is now Aardvark Section 
Co-ordinator. Andrew, however, will continue to provide 
us with valued expertise. Andrew, thank you for your 
past guidance - and welcome Tom! 

We continue to fine-tune our website 
(http://www.calacademy.org/research/bmammals/afrot
heria/ASG.html). Gary Bronner assembled material for 
the golden moles section and several of our specialist 
group members interested in the aardvark are working on 
an update of that section. I continue to update the sengi 
material, and PJ Stephenson is assembling material on 
tenrecs. We also implemented some improvements 
suggested by our members, including a new home page 
menu link to conservation issues, assembled by Rob 
Asher. Contact Rob to contribute material to these pages. 

Thanks, again, for all your time and effort in 
continuing to keep the lesser-known afrotheres in the 
spotlight. 
 
G.B. Rathbun  
Cambria, California. 1 December 2007 
 
  

Species Profile: 
Streaked tenrecs, Hemicentetes 
 
P.J. Stephenson 
WWF International, Avenue du Mont Blanc, CH-1196 
Gland, Switzerland. 
pjstephenson@wwfint.org
 
The incredible adaptive radiation of the Tenrecidae on 
Madagascar is well demonstrated by streaked tenrecs of 
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the genus Hemicentetes. The two species in this genus, the 
lowland streaked tenrec (H. semispinosus) and the highland 
streaked tenrec (H. nigriceps), exhibit the relatively 
ancestral characteristics of an ancient lineage of 
mammals, while at the same time showing many highly 
adapted behavioural and morphological characteristics 
(see Eisenberg and Gould 1970, Olson and Goodman 
2003).  

Both species of Hemicentetes are recognized by 
their streaked appearance (Eisenberg and Gould 1970, 
Garbutt 1999). The upperparts of H. semispinosus are 
characterized by well-developed spines with yellow to 
orange longitudinal stripes. The dorsum of H. nigriceps 
has less developed, dull white to pale yellow spines that 
form broad lateral stripes. The crown and head are black 
and lack the yellow stripe that runs from nose to crown 
in H. semispinosus. The underfur in H. nigriceps is more 
developed, giving it a “woolly” appearance. The striped 
patterning of Hemicentetes provides a degree of crypsis 
when foraging. Immature common tenrecs (Tenrec 
ecaudatus) have similar striped patterning on their upper 
body, probably for the same reason, though this 
common adaptation may also reflect a close ancestry 
between these two genera (Eisenberg and Gould 1970, 
Nicoll 1983). 

Hemicentetes semispinosus is the slightly larger 
species, with a head-body length of 130-190 mm and a 
mass of 90-220 g, compared to H. nigriceps, at 120-160 
mm and 70-160 g (Stephenson 1991, Garbutt 1999). 
Body mass for both species varies seasonally, with a peak 
around March - April (Stephenson and Racey 1994).  
Both lack tails and have pronounced, pointed snouts. 
Quills in both species are barbed and detachable and are 
particularly prominent around the crown or nuchal crest. 
When agitated, streaked tenrecs raise the spines on the 
nuchal crest and, if further provoked, they resort to a 
head-butting action to embed spines in the aggressor. 
Besides camouflage and defence, streaked tenrecs use 
spines for intraspecific communication. The stridulating 
organ on the dorsum is able to vibrate quills together to 
create ultrasonic sounds that are detected by other 
individuals up to four metres away (Gould 1965, Wever 
and Herman 1968).  
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© L.E. Olson & S.M. Goodman 
A lowland streaked tenrec, Hemicentetes semispinosus.  
 
Streaked tenrecs occur in primary and secondary forest 
and are often seen on agricultural land and in gardens 
(Eisenberg and Gould 1970). The species are usually 
allopatric (occurring in different geographical areas) as H. 
nigriceps is largely confined to the central highlands and H. 

semispinosus is found in lower lying rain forest (see 
Goodman et al. 2000 for review). Even where their 
ranges overlap, such as on the mountains that skirt the 
eastern edge of the central highlands and the eastern 
escarpment, they generally occur at widely differing 
elevations. H. nigriceps occurs in montane and sclerao-
phyllous forests and above the forest line, whereas H. 
semispinosus occurs in lowland forest and clearings near 
the forest edge. However, the two species were found 
living in sympatry at 1550 m in Mahatsinjo Forest, 
dispelling any lingering notion that they were the same 
species (Goodman et al. 2000).  

Hemicentetes excavate burrows, which may be up to 
150 cm in length and about 15 cm below the surface of 
the ground, containing a single nest chamber (Eisenberg 
and Gould 1970). Leaves may be used to plug the 
entrance hole. Although H. semispinosus is often recorded 
foraging in daylight hours, H. nigriceps is strictly nocturnal, 
with peak activity occurring three to four hours after 
darkness. Both species forage among leaf litter on the 
forest floor. They have reduced dentition, reflecting their 
specialized diet of earthworms and other soft-bodied 
invertebrates (Gould and Eisenberg 1966, Eisenberg and 
Gould 1970).  Carnivores such as Cryptoprocta ferox, Fossa 
fossana, and Galidia elegans, as well as large snakes, prey 
upon them.  

Both species of Hemicentetes exhibit a reduction in 
activity during the austral winter (Gould and Eisenberg 
1966), apparently brought about by endogenous rhythms 
(or an “inner clock”) entrained by ambient temperature 
or photoperiod or both (Stephenson and Racey 1994). H. 
semispinosus is a facultative hibernator (Stephenson and 
Racey 1994) and, if favourable climatic conditions 
prevail, it is able to remain active and can breed all year 
round. The ability of this species to avoid torpor may 
increase reproductive output and provide a competitive 
advantage. H. nigriceps is an obligate hibernator which 
enters a more profound torpor and aestivates from 
around May to October (Stephenson and Racey 1994). 
Throughout the austral winter body temperature in both 
species is maintained at less than 20C above ambient, and 
resting metabolic rate (RMR) is reduced by up to 75%. 
Both species have levels of RMR lower than expected for 
mammals of their size but similar to other tenrecs. 
During reproduction, females experience elevated RMR 
and an associated improvement in homeothermy 
(Stephenson and Racey 1994). 

Hemicentetes is the most precocious tenrec. After a 
gestation length of 55-63 days (relatively long for a small 
mammal but typical of a tenrec), the neonates mature 
more rapidly than any other species in the family 
(Eisenberg and Gould 1970, Eisenberg 1975, Stephenson 
1991, Stephenson et al. 1994). Neonates open their eyes 
at 7-12 days and are weaned within 3 weeks. H. 
semispinosus is sexually mature at 35-40 days, whereas 
other spiny tenrecs do not mate until they are at least six 
months old. Litter size in H. nigriceps is 2-4 with a mean of 
2.8, whereas H. semsipinosus has 2-11 neonates per litter 
with a mean of 6.6. Neonate weight in both species is just 
over eight grams at birth (Stephenson et al. 1994). 
Longevity in the wild is unknown but H. nigriceps has 
lived for more than three years in captivity (Stephenson et 
al. 1994). 

H. semispinosus lives in multi-generation groups 
with one of the most complex social systems known in 
an afrotherian. Because of the speed of maturation and 
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relatively large litter size, a family group may comprise 
more than 20 individuals from three related generations. 
They forage together, maintaining contact between 
individuals and subgroups through use of the stridulating 
organ. Little is known of the social organization of H. 
nigriceps. This reflects the fact that, although research 
published largely in the 1970s and 1990s improved our 
understanding of streaked tenrecs, much remains to be 
discovered about the behaviour, social organization and 
microhabitat use of these fascinating and unique animals.   

The ability of streaked tenrecs to adapt to 
anthropogenic environments means they are not 
threatened. In addition, both species are found in a 
number of protected areas within their ranges (Nicoll and 
Langrand 1989). 
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Longevity and fecundity in sengis 
(Macroscelidea) 
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gealex@online.de
 
Introduction 
 
Longevity records of mammals have elicited interest for 
many years. Most data rely on information from captive 
animals. Summarized information was published by 
Schmidt (1880), Jones (1968, 1982, 1993) and Weigl 
(1993, 2005). Information on the lifespans of free-
ranging animals is hard to collect. In addition, wild 
animals face life-threatening situations with predators, 
intraspecific competition, disease and sometimes 
suboptimal diet, so the achievement of maximum life-
span is unlikely. 

Referring to unusual reproductive performances 
and ages achieved by captive small mammals, Egoscue et 
al. (1970) argued that, although maximum-recorded 
longevities establish species potentials and measure the 
suitability of the conditions under which the animal is 
kept, in practice such data has limited field application. In 
contrast, Holmes and Austad (1994) take into account 
that maximum-recorded longevities for captive animals 
are a generally-accepted index of maximum potential 
lifespan. Manville (1957) states that understanding the 
variability in lifespan among vertebrates may be useful to 
various field workers studying wild animals. Snyder and 
Moore (1968) emphasize the potential value of longevity 
data to scientists concerned with the problems of ageing.  
 
Longevity in sengis 
 
Lifespans for several sengi species are presented in Table 
1. As expected, recorded longevity in wild specimens is 
shorter than in captive ones. Information on wild 
individuals is scarce. For some species no data are 
available. For captive animals, average recorded lifespan 
has increased over time due to improvements in meeting 
dietary requirements (Snyder and Moore 1968). 

Rathbun (1979a) expected wild Rhynchocyon 
chrysopygus to live four to five years; yet some years later a 
captive specimen was found to have reached the age of 
almost 11 years (Weigl 2005) This was the longest 
lifespan for a macroscelid ever recorded; the second 
longest was E. intufi with nine years and Macroscelides 
proboscideus and E. rufescens with about eight years.  

The contrast between the wild lifespan record in 
E. rufescens of 1.5 years (Rathbun 1979b) and the captive 
record of 8 years (Weigl 2005) further highlights the 
difficulty in extrapolating data to determine factors such 
as lifetime reproductive potential. 
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Table 1. Longevity records for several species of sengis. 
The data for captive animals was minimum age, and 
some animals were wild born. y=years, m=months (all 
captive records by Weigl, 2005). 
 

Longevity Species 
In the wild In captivity 

Rhynchocyon chrysopygus 4 or 5y (Rathbun 
1979a) 

>11y 

R. petersi  4y 6m 
Petrodromus 
tetradactylus 

 6y 7m 

Macroscelides 
proboscideus 

 8y 8m 

Elephantulus edwardii  5y 8m 
E. brachyrhynchus   4y 2m 
E. intufi  9y 3m 
E. rozeti >2 y  

(Séguignes, 1989) 
7y 2m 

E. rufescens >1y 7m  
(Rathbun, 1979b) 

7y 11m 

E. rupestris  4y 2m 
E. myurus jamesoni normally 1y 1 m, 

exceptionally 1y 
7m (van der Horst, 
1946) 

 

 
Fecundity in sengis 
 
Increasing age may lead to a decline in breeding 
performance and survival. This correlation is subject to 
further investigation in Macroscelides proboscideus (Olbricht 
diss. in prep) but examples given here help to offer further 
insight. 

A captive born male round-eared sengi at 
Wuppertal Zoo, Germany, had 23 litters with 44 
offspring to date, all but two with the same mate. This 
male had his first litter born when he was aged six 
months and three days. Only the two first litters were 
single births, all others were twin litters. Most recently his 
last litter of surviving twins was born when he was six 
years and three months. Almost all of his breeding life, 
except for the two first litters, he has been with the same 
mate and was never separated from her or his newborn 
young. This pair, which is still alive, produced a total of 
21 twin litters to date. The female was eight months old 
at the time of the first litter, and her most recent one was 
at the age of four years and nine months. In exceptional 
cases both sexes achieve sexual maturity earlier (Olbricht 
et al. 2006). Another captive born female at Wuppertal 
Zoo had 22 litters with 40 young during her lifespan of 
almost six years. Among those, were 16 twin pairs, 5 
singletons and the unusual birth of triplets. All single 
births and three of the twin litters occurred after she had 
reached the age of three and a half and all these young, 
except one, died right after birth. This example suggests 
reduced fecundity with older age, as suggested by Harvey 
and Zammuto (1985). Nevertheless, reproduction was 
possible until the end of the female’s life, with the last 
litter occurring three months before her death.  

The relatively long breeding history demonstrated 
in these cases contrasts with van der Horst (1946) and 
McKerrow (1954) who expected female Elephantulus 
myurus jamesoni to die of old age after their third 
pregnancy.  
 
 

Life history 
 
Two determining factors for the fecundity of individuals 
are lifespan and inter-litter intervals (Promislow and 
Harvey 1990). In fact, continuous breeding with short 
inter-birth intervals following post-partum oestrous (e.g. 
van der Horst 1944, Kingdon 1990), and a long lifespan 
(see Table 1) reveal the high reproductive potential of 
sengis.  

Sengis have a number of behavioural and 
ecological traits that may represent adaptations to 
improved survivorship, such as predator avoidance by 
young (Sauer 1972) and by adults (Rathbun 1979b), risk-
sensitive foraging (Lawes and Perrin 1995), defending a 
territory (Ribble and Perrin 2005) and varied diet 
(Bernard et al. 1996). 

The “K-selected” traits of sengis require an 
effective quality breeding performance over a long life 
time. This is in line with Harvey and Zammuto (1985) 
and Promislow and Harvey (1990) who support an 
evolutionary link between low mortality rates, delayed 
reproduction and long lifespans. 

Jones (1982) suggested that an increase in lifespan 
is a direct consequence of an increase in body size. The 
long-term survival of sengis, despite their small body size, 
does not support this finding and ancestral sengis were 
not likely to be much smaller than extant species (Evans 
1942, Patterson 1965, Simons et al. 1991). 
 
Conclusions 
 
Information on captive sengis allows us to draw some 
assumptions on potential lifespans as well as potential 
fecundity of particular species. This knowledge may have 
relevance in determining the capacity of species to 
recover from population declines, which is especially  
important for the threatened sengis listed under the 
IUCN categories “vulnerable” and “endangered” (Nicoll 
and Rathbun 1990, Boitani et al. 1999).                                                     
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African sengis (Order Macroscelidea) are confined in 
their distribution to sub-Saharan Africa with the 
exception of a single species present in North Africa. 
Within Southern Africa, nine species are recognized 
representative of three of the four described genera. The 
Cape rock sengi (Elephantulus edwardii) is the only strictly 
South African endemic sengi. The distribution of this 
afrotherian has recently been updated (Skinner and 
Chimimba 2005) and data now suggest that E. edwardii is 
continuously distributed (rather than two disjunct 
groups) from Namaqualand in the Western Cape 
Province to Port Elizabeth in the Eastern Cape Province, 
a distribution that spans several recognized biomes in 
South Africa (Succulent Karoo, Nama Karoo, and 
Fynbos; Low and Rebelo 1996; Mucina and Rutherford 
2006). 

The Cape rock sengi is monogamous, territorial 
and is confined to a habitat of rocky outcrops (Skinner 
and Chimimba 2005). Intuitively one would expect that 
these life history characteristics would play an important 
role in shaping the spatial distribution of genetic 
variation, and that this variation would be structured 
across the landscape. Our aim here is to describe the 
phylogeographic population structure of the Cape rock 
sengi and to correlate this pattern to the processes and 
vicariant events that might have caused it. For this we 
included 106 sengi specimens sampled from 26 localities 
throughout the species distribution. The value of 
museum and other archived specimens (including type 
specimens) has been largely underestimated in many 
molecular studies, especially where species have a low 
abundance and / or are listed by the IUCN as worthy of 
special conservation attention, a situation typified by the 
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Cape rock sengi (IUCN Red List 2004: concern; IUCN 
Red List 2006: least concern). Of the 106 specimens 
included in our study, 64 are housed in South African 
museums. In addition, we also included the type 
specimens of all the previously described, but currently 
synonymized species and subspecies.  
 

 
© Arnaud Gregoire 

A Cape rock sengi (Elephantulus edwardii) in the Ceder-
berg, South Africa. 
 
Some sengi species are phenotypically very similar, 
rendering field identification problematic. As such, we 
verified the field identification of all specimens included 
in this study using genetic distinctiveness as an indicator 
of species differences. For this, we included repre-
sentative specimens of the three Southern African sengi 
species with overlapping ranges  in the Western Cape (E. 
edwardii, E. rupestris and M. proboscideus) and, based on 
their genetic profiles, demonstrated that these are indeed 
distinct species. Within the Cape rock sengi, a spatial 
analysis of molecular variation provided unequivocal 
evidence of three (geographically and genetically) distinct 
lineages namely a Karoo, northern Namaqua and central 
Fynbos clade. The most distinct lineage was the Karoo 
lineage, representing the localities of Williston {30.2S 
20.8E} and Beaufort-West {32.4S 22.6E}. Based on our 
genetic data, this lineage does not correspond to any of 
the previously described species / subspecies (E. karoensis 
Roberts 1938 and E. capensis Roberts 1924) and is new to 
science. This is supported by our analysis of several 
phenotypic characters including tuft length on the tail, 
the ventral and dorsal pelage and flank colour as well as 
the colour and shape of the eye ring (a scientific paper is 
currently in preparation describing this lineage as a new 
species).  

Importantly, our results reveal the morphological 
misidentification of the E. karoensis type specimen which 
was grouped with E. rupestris, highlighting the problems 
of field identification among sengi species. The apparent 
misidentification of the E. karoensis type was sub-
sequently confirmed by an examination of morphological 
and dental characters which suggest that Roberts’ (1938) 
original classification was misled by the specimen’s sub-
adult pelage.   

The northern Namaqua clade occurs along the 
Atlantic seaboard close to the South African - Namibian 
border with the central Fynbos clade distributed through-
out the Cape Floristic Province. The geographic barrier 
between these two distinct clades appears to be the 
Knersvlakte region {30.5S 18.6E}. Importantly, this 
geographic delimitation corresponds closely to patterns 
reported for other rock-dwelling vertebrate species, the 

rock rabbit (Pronolagus rupestris; Matthee and Robinson 
1996), and the rock agama (Agama atra; Matthee and 
Flemming 2002), indicating a shared biogeographic 
history for rock-dwelling taxa along the west coast of 
South Africa. Two independent methods of molecular 
dating indicate that these two evolutionary lineages 
separated ~1.7 million years ago (MYA). We speculate 
that various topographical and climatic events might have 
either singly, or in concert, repeatedly enforced the 
population fragmentation across the Knersvlakte. For 
example, at roughly two MYA (Linder 2003) a series of 
Pleistocene marine transgressions inundated the western 
coastal plains with rises in sea-levels of between 45-50m, 
75-90m and 27m (Hendey 1970a, b).  Secondly, changes 
in river-flow patterns could also have served as isolating 
mechanisms. Thirdly, Deacon and Lancaster (1988) 
argued that climatic changes during the past three million 
years were particularly harsh on the western side of the 
continent resulting in temperature fluctuations and 
associated wet-dry cycles. Lastly, recent Kalahari sand-
flows occurred from the north to the south which would 
have acted as a physical barrier separating populations 
(Deacon and Lancaster 1988).   

Finally, four evolutionary lineages were identified 
within the central Fynbos clade found within the relative 
safety of the Cape Fold Mountains (CFM) at the 
southern tip of Africa. We argue that the geographic 
occurrence of these four lineages broadly resembles the 
climatic differences and vegetation types related to the 
position of these mountain ranges. The high degree of 
diversity and endemism of the renowned Cape Floristic 
Province are credited to environmental fluctuations from 
the Pliocene and Pleistocene epochs (Midgley et al. 2001; 
Linder 2003) coinciding with the separation times (0.7 - 
0.24 MYA) between the four evolutionary lineages.   

 
For a full description of this work, see Smit, H.A., 
Robinson, T.J. and Jansen van Vuuren, B. 2007. Coal-
escence methods reveal the impact of vicariance on the 
spatial genetic structure of Elephantulus edwardii (Afro-
theria, Macroscelidea). Molecular Ecology, 16: 2680-2692. 
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The International Species Information System (ISIS) is a 
database that was established in 1973. It currently 
includes records of nearly two million animals submitted 
by 700 member institutions in 72 countries (mostly zoos, 
but some universities). Out of the 15 species of sengi 
currently recognized, only nine are represented in the 
database and only two are currently in captivity.  In 
Figure 1 we present data from three commonly held 
species. 

Although there had been scattered early successes 
in breeding sengis in captivity, the first widespread 
success was with the rufous sengi (Elephantulus rufescens).  
Indeed, numerous popular and scientific papers were 
produced based on the founding 14 animals at the 
National Zoological Park in Washington, D.C. and their 
subsequent multiple generations in zoos across North 
America. However, after about 15 years this species com-
pletely disappeared from captivity. We believe that this 
“boom and bust” cycle was due to the initial novelty of 
captive sengis eventually being lost and the lack of any 
institution taking the lead in developing and maintaining 
a genealogical history of the captives (“studbook”). 

The round-eared sengi (Macroscelides proboscideus) 
has been successfully kept in captivity well before ISIS 
began compiling data, but not until relatively recently has 
the population of captives shown a boom – mostly in 

Europe. Similar to the rufous sengi, the large number of 
captives has resulted in a bloom of publications on this 
species. However, given the large number of institutions 
keeping this species, but the comparatively small total 
number in captivity, and the lack of a studbook, we 
wonder if a bust is on the horizon. 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 
Figure 1: ISIS data on three species of sengi held in 
captivity. 
 
The giant sengis (genus Rhynchocyon with three species) 
are large, strictly diurnal, and very appealing animals – 
arguably one of the more charismatic small mammals in 
the world (yes, we are biased). They all are threatened or 
near-threatened on the IUCN Red List.  Most attempts at 
maintaining them in captivity have failed. The Frankfurt 
Zoo, however, was the first to succeed by keeping 
golden-rumped sengis (R. chrysopygus) for many years - but 
they never bred. Alan Root, the well-known African 
cinematographer, kept chequered sengis (R. cirnei), which 
were featured in a National Geographic Society film 
“Heart of Africa – Forest Primeval”.  
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A black and rufous sengi (Rhynchocyon petersi) female with 
infant in Philadelphia Zoo. 

 
The greatest success, however, has been with the black-
and-rufous sengi (R. petersi), which is now held by several 
zoological parks in North America. As reported in 
Afrotherian Conservation issue 3, the Philadelphia Zoo has 
been particularly successful in breeding this species. The 
captive population is still small and it is probably too 
soon to predict whether this species will go through the 
boom and bust cycle. Because it is an excellent display 
animal, and a studbook has been established, perhaps 
there is hope that these animals will persist in captivity 
and continue to be a showcase for sengis. 

We view captive breeding of great importance for 
three main reasons. First, the husbandry skills developed 
may prove to be critical in preventing extinctions.  
Secondly, displaying captives has immense educational 
potential, especially for raising awareness of rare and 
threatened species. Thirdly, maintaining captives often 
produces invaluable scientific knowledge, including 
insights that are difficult to gather from free-living 
animals.  We hope that the boom and bust cycle can be 
avoided, especially with unusual, rare, and threatened 
species, which includes a large proportion of the 
afrotheria.  
 
 

Afrotheria News 

Survey of the golden-rumped sengi 
planned north of the Tana in Kenya 
 
E.M. Mwangi  
University of Nairobi; School of Biological Sciences, P.O. 
Box 30197 00100 Nairobi, Kenya 
emmwangi@uonbi.ac.ke
 
A new study aimed at establishing the status of the 
golden-rumped sengi (Rhynchocyon chrysopygus) is being 
developed by the University of Nairobi’s conservation 
biology programme. It is intended to cover the forests 
north of the Tana River along the Kenyan coast. 

According to available records, the historical 
distribution of the sengi extended all along the eastern 
African coastal forests, stretching from northern Mozam-
bique to southern Somalia. This was once a continuous 
swathe of forest, or closely interconnected forest patches. 

Throughout recent history, human encroachment 
has seriously impacted on sengi habitat as a result of 
uncontrolled logging, clearing for cultivation and 

urbanisation. Rapid human population growth has also 
led to sengis being extensively hunted for meat. They are 
also exposed to severe predation pressure, including by 
feral dogs. Consequently the species has suffered a 
drastic reduction in both numbers and distribution. 
Currently, it is only known to occur in small isolated 
coastal forests north of Mombasa. It is only in the 
Arabuko Sokoke Forest (ASF) and five smaller patches 
around it that its status is reasonably well known from 
recent studies. There is ample reason, however, to believe 
that the sengi occurs in the forests north of the Tana 
River where habitats are still relatively intact and human 
impact is low. 

In the new survey, which is expected to 
commence with a hands-on training for field researchers 
within the ASF, we hope to update out present 
knowledge of the species’ conservation needs in ASF, 
and establish authoritatively the presence of sengis in the 
forests further north, including the Boni and other 
forests between the delta and Kiunga. 

Site visits, live-trapping, and interviews with local 
residents will be used to determine the presence of sengis 
and the conservation status of forest habitats found to be 
occupied by sengis.  The survey methodology will follow 
that developed by earlier researchers, with appropriate 
modifications to suit local conditions. Survey efforts will 
be directed towards establishing the relative densities and 
other attributes of the species’ ecology in different 
habitats.  

Golden-rumped sengis create leaf nests on the 
forest floor and previous studies have shown that the 
abundance of leaf nests is related to sengi density. It is 
proposed to carry out transects in different habitats to 
compare nest abundance and therefore, sengi abundance 
in different habitats. It is hoped that information on the 
distribution of these habitats from aerial or satellite 
photographs will then help to establish an approximate 
estimate of the current distribution of the sengi. 

An assessment of the distribution and relative 
abundance of the golden-rumped sengi in suitable 
habitats in areas north of the Tana River would have 
considerable bearing on its conservation status. The 
findings of this survey will also be critical in further 
underscoring the importance of the ASF as a biodiversity 
hotspot, home to six endangered bird species, two of 
which are endemic, and to three rare mammals. 

A graduate student from the University of 
Nairobi is developing a proposal for this survey. The 
survey is expected to commence in October 2007 and 
end before the next major rains in March-April 2008. 
The results will go towards the student’s MSc thesis and 
is expected to be published in scientific journals. 

The golden-rumped sengi has been selected as 
one of the focal species for the Zoological Society of 
London’s recently launched EDGE (Evolutionarily 
Distinct and Globally Endangered) programme. EDGE 
species have few close relatives and therefore represent a 
disproportionate amount of unique evolutionary history. 
Many of them are on the verge of extinction and yet are 
receiving little or no conservation attention. It is hoped 
that the University of Nairobi student will be selected as 
an EDGE fellow, and thereby receive funding and 
support from this programme. However, we will need to 
raise further funding to enable the survey to be 
completed. Any suggestions for funding sources would 
therefore be gratefully received. 
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Afrotheria Noticeboard 
 

New aardvark website 
 
A new website has been launched that focuses entirely on 
one of the Afrotheria – the aardvark.  

Visit www.aardvarkafrica.org and you will 
discover a lot about this fascinating creature. The site has 
a factsheet and pages explaining the importance of the 
aardvark to the environment and to other species, details 
of its biology  and its conservation needs. There is also a 
photo gallery.  
 
For more information contact Stefan Cilliers 
(stefancilliers@absamail.co.za) 
 
 
 
 

Abstracts 
 
 
This section presents abstracts from recent papers on the 
Afrotheria.  
 
 

Reproductive biology of the 
short-eared sengi 
 
Olbricht, G., Kern, C. and Vakhrusheva, G. 2006. Einige 
Aspekte der Fortpflanzungsbiologie von Kurzohr-
Russelspringern (Macroscelides proboscideus A. Smith, 1829) 
in Zoologischen Garten unter besonderer 
Berucksichtigung von Drillingswurfen. Der Zoologische 
Garten, 75:304-316. 
 
This paper covers some aspects of the reproductive 
biology of the short-eared sengi(Macroscelides proboscideus 
A. Smith, 1829) in captivity, with special consideration to 
triplet litters 
 
Short-eared sengis occur in some dry regions of Namibia, 
Botswana and South Africa. In the wild as well as in 
captivity they breed throughout the year but are 
particularly free ranging. Short-eared sengis show 
seasonal trends. Litters with one or two cubs are well 
documented but the birth of triplets has never been 
mentioned. In this study 570 litters from different zoos 
were analyzed. The results show that 29% were born 
single, 70% as twins and 0.9% as triplets. Females can 
reach sexual maturity at the age of four months, while 
males reach sexual maturity at 2.8 months. Out of 774 
individuals born, 44% were males, 41% females and 15% 
of unknown sex. 
 

A new species of shrew tenrec 
 

Goodman, S.M., Raxworthy, C.J., Maminirina, C.P. and 
Olson, L.E. 2006. A new species of shrew tenrec 
(Microgale jobihely) from northern Madagascar. Journal of 
Zoology, London, 270: 384–398. 

A new species of shrew tenrec in the genus Microgale is 
described from a series of 12 specimens taken on the 
south-western slopes of the Tsaratanana Massif in 
northern Madagascar and is named Microgale jobihely. This 
new species is distinguished from other named members 
of this endemic genus by a variety of mensural and 
discrete morphological characters. Phylogenetic analysis 
of the mitochondrial ND2 gene supports its recognition 
as a distinct species and suggests a sister relationship with 
the much more widespread Microgale cowani. Microgale 
jobihely appears to be the only member of this genus that 
is a very localized endemic, and a biogeographic scenario 
is presented to explain this observation. It is currently 
known from a small area of forest, outside of the 
protected areas system, that faces considerable 
anthropogenic pressure. 
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                   © PJ Stephenson 
 
The lesser hedgehog tenrec, Echinops telfairi, is one of the five spiny tenrecs (sub-family Tenrecinae). Echinops is also one of 
just a handful of tenrecs that are adapted to life in the semi-arid conditions of the spiny forest in south-west Madagascar.  It 
is nocturnal and semi-arboreal, capable of climbing on tree branches. The lesser hedgehog tenrec is omnivorous, feeding 
primarily on invertebrates and fruits. When food and water are scarce it is capable of entering seasonal torpor. Litter size is 
relatively high compared with most other tenrecs, with up to 10 young born at once. The dry forest habitat of Echinops is 
under threat from slash and burn agriculture and charcoal production. However, lesser hedgehog tenrecs are the most 
common tenrec species held in captivity; it is even kept as a pet in some countries. 
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